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ABSTRACT: Machine Learning approaches are abundantly used over the globe for identification of different 
approaches related to real life scenario. There is a required scenario to be included in machine learning approach to 
identify the human nature based on his current health condition. A better health leads to a person to be active in all his 
activities and if at all he disturbs with anyone will distract him in all his activities until that issue resolves. Here what 
we mean is when a person is having a critical health issue and it will effect his/her current nature or mood which will 
effect that person in two ways. In this article we are presenting our research component which is to identify the current 
nature or mood of the person based on his health issues and what are the treatment he was given and how to predict the 
things related to him which he is going to be perform in future and what are the two things to be affected in his life 
because of the health issue and current nature he is having. This approach will use Neural Networks and other effective 
Machine Learning algorithms to design and effective prediction model which will help for the doctors, practitioners and 
also researchers to understand and perform better healthcare models and based on their requirement related to the 
patient. An effective deep learning approach will also help this research based on which we can map the relations 
between the health information systems and health information data. We need to correlate between data variables 
related to the scenario we are considering. 
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I. INTRODUCTION 
 

Human health and Nature of the person are directly proportional to each other. If the person is not feeling well he may 
show that effect to his work and the people surrounding him or her in their work place or anywhere. There is a chance 
of behaving in a rude manner if there is any health issue he or she may be facing and they are not diagnosed properly 
and because of it they may behave in a wrong way and nature will change from time to time. This may show effect in 
future if the case is got worst. In this article we are focusing on identification of the problem of the patient based on his 
or her present mental condition or we can call that as the nature of the patient because of which he may get effect in 
some other place. Let’s take a real time example. A person was joined in corporate and he was facing lot of trouble 
with the implementation of the project and finally because of the over pressure and stress he got lot of health issues like 
not feeling starving, overweight, dumbness in body parts, eyes problem, migraine, sinus etc. He may have the chance of 
urinary bladder obstruction. If the person is suffering with over stress and pressure he have most of the chance of 
getting UTI. Which cause the internal obstruction and leads to damage of the internal organs of the body. We may think 
that the person is having stomach ache and he may get cured by the tablets and small treatments. But the case is he may 
behave weird suddenly because of the pain he may face for UTI and he cannot express the factors or symptoms he is 
having[1-6] 
 
In this research we are considering some mental disorder patients data sets using which we need to compare and 
correlated the EHR treatment datasets with the normal treatment details and also we need to consider the mental 
disorder patients dataset for the reference and better utilization of machine learning approaches in the real time 
scenario. In this article we are explaining the process we are following for better design of the data collection and what 
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are the things the patient is facing and predict the treatment and medication for the patient. 
 
There is another novel thing we are trying to implement is identifying the operation that patient may do in future 
because of his or her current health condition, mental condition. For better understanding of the people around us we 
need to consider this type of applications and architecture to save people, save health, better utilization of technology, 
helps people to work according to their wish and needs, give better treatment and medication without regular access to 
the doctors.[7-13] 
 
In further sections of the section we are considering the current scenarios and types of EHR applications and what are 
the machine learning models are using for implementation of the research, What are the disadvantages of using current 
methodology in this concept, expected result and conclude the research work in final section. 
 

II. RELATED LITERATURE SURVEY AND IMPLEMENTATIONS 
 
In this section we will discuss about the different EHR applications which are available for better implementation of 
data collection and pre-processing of the data. If we need to pre-process the data need to eliminate the missing values 
and reduce the errors in the dataset.[14-17] 
 
a. Mobile health Application 
 
In this kind of mobile EHR applications we need to wear a device which is connected to the mobile application and will 
give update to the user to do some tasks and update the same to the application and that application will be accessed by 
the server and doctors can watch that details of the current position of his patient and can give some of the suggestions 
to the patient when he comes to the review. The below is the sample application of the mobile EHR application 
 
Figure 1 explains the basic architecture of the mobile EHR application in which we can get oximeter access and 
updates the same oxygen levels in the body in the application and that application will give some support 
methodologies if the patient is not in a position to work or operate properly in his work. 
 

 
Figure 1: Mobile EHR band the person has to wear and connect to the mobile applications. 
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Figure 2: Oximeter for indentifying oxygen levels in the body 
 
In the above two figures we can get a basic idea on what the mobile EHR applications works. 
 
b. Time Series Based. 
 
We have EHR applications which are based on the  Time series management. In this kind of applications we can track 
the graphs of the condition of the person using the mobile application as well as the device which is there in the 
hospital which is related to mobile EHR application. 
 
Figure 3 explains the time series comparison of the task in EHR application. 

 
Figure 3: Time series management in HER 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Figure 4: Change point detection based on the Bayesian classifier. 
 
Here we used Bayesian classifier for better implementation of the EHR applications in the hospitals[18-19] 
 

http://www.ijircce.com


 

         
                  
                    ISSN(Online): 2320-9801 
              ISSN (Print):  2320-9798                                                                                                                         

                                                                                   

International Journal of Innovative Research in Computer 
and Communication Engineering 

(A High Impact Factor, Monthly, Peer Reviewed Journal) 

Website: www.ijircce.com  

Vol. 7, Issue 5, May 2019 
 

Copyright to IJIRCCE                                                        DOI: 10.15680/IJIRCCE.2019. 0705088                                               3132  

 

c. Community Electronic Health Records 
 
These CEHR (Community Electronic Health Records) is based on connecting the devices to the main server and gather 
the medical data based on the community purpose in a group of operations and we can get the common factors in the 
data available in the community EHR. 
 
For example we can consider ResScan as the basic example of the CEHR. Figure 5 is the basic operation of that device. 
[7-9] 

 
Figure 5: Patient details graph 

 
In this scenario we can consider another type of approach like patient suicidal approach. Through which we can 
identify the nature of the person and can try to avoid the faults in him/her. 
 
Patients with self-destructive ideation can be recognized from non-self-destructive people with high precision by 
applying machine-learning procedures to the portrayal of death-and life-related ideas in the cerebrum, reports a paper 
distributed online this week in Nature Human Behavior. This strategy can likewise recognize self-destructive ideators 
who have influenced a suicide to endeavor from the individuals who have not. 
 
As per the World Health Organization, near 800,000 individuals bite the dust by suicide consistently. The evaluation of 
suicide chance is among the most difficult issues confronting emotional well-being clinicians: self-destructive patients 
much of the time mask their goal to confer suicide, while clinicians' forecasts of suicide chance have appeared to be 
poor. Markers of suicide hazard that don't depend on self- reports are accordingly much required. 
 
Marcel Just, David Brent, and partners introduced self- destructive patients and control people experiencing utilitarian 
attractive reverberation imaging (fMRI) examines with death- and life-related words. They found that neural movement 
because of six of the words (demise, mercilessness, inconvenience, joyful, great and laud) and in five mind areas best 
segregated between the self-destructive patients and controls. The creators at that point prepared a machine- learning 
calculation to utilize this data to distinguish which members were patients and which were controls. The calculation 
effectively distinguished 15 of 17 patients as having a place with the suicide gathering and 16 of 17 sound people as 
having a place with the control gathering. The creators went ahead to research only the self-destructive patients, who 
were isolated into two gatherings: the individuals who had endeavored suicide (nine members) and the individuals who 
had not (eight members). The creators prepared another calculation that effectively recognized suicide attempters and 
non-attempters in 16 out of 17 cases. 
 
The investigation's little example estimate requires replication. Be that as it may, as Barry Horwitz notes in a going 
with News and Views, if reproduced and stretched out to other mental populaces, the technique created by Just and 
partners and comparative utilitarian neuroimaging strategies can possibly turn into a noteworthy therapeutic instrument 
for the analysis of neuropsychiatric issue. 
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The clinical evaluation of self-destructive hazard would be generously supplemented by a naturally based measure that 
surveys modifications in the neural portrayals of ideas identified with death and life in individuals who participate in 
self-destructive ideation. This examination utilized machine- learning calculations (Gaussian Naive Bayes) to 
distinguish such people (17 self-destructive ideators versus 17 controls) with high (91%) exactness, in view of their 
adjusted practical attractive reverberation imaging neural marks of death-related and life-related ideas. The most 
segregating ideas were 'demise', 'brutality', 'inconvenience', 'joyful', 'great' and 'acclaim'. A comparative arrangement 
precisely (94%) separated nine self-destructive ideators who had influenced a suicide to endeavor from eight who had 
not. Additionally, a noteworthy feature of the idea adjustments was the evoked feeling, whose neural mark filled in as 
an elective reason for precise (85%) amass characterization. This examination sets up an organic, neurocognitive reason 
for adjusted idea portrayals in members with self-destructive ideation, which empowers exceptionally precise gathering 
enrollment grouping. 
 
Suicide is a noteworthy general wellbeing concern. More than 40,000 individuals across the nation bite the dust by 
suicide every year. Suicide was the second driving reason for death in 2015 for youthful grown-ups matured 18 to 26. 
Knowing who is in danger for suicide may help lessen the suicide rate. 
 

Researchers have been trying a few ways to deal with attempt to anticipate suicide hazard. An exploration group drove 
by Dr. Marcel Just at Carnegie Mellon University and Dr. David Brent at the University of Pittsburgh utilized fMRI to 
search for marks of cerebrum movement among youthful grown-ups with self-destructive contemplations. They 
concentrated on the systems of action that speak to ideas and the feelings they inspire. Their examination was 
subsidized by NIH's National Institute of Mental Health (NIMH). It seemed online in Nature Human Behavior on 
October 30, 2017. 
 
The group enrolled 38 youthful grown-ups with current self- destructive considerations and 41 sound controls with no 
history of a mental issue or suicide endeavor. While in a fMRI scanner, the members were demonstrated 30 words for 3 
seconds each identified with suicide (e.g., "passing," memorial service," miserable"), positive thoughts ("delight," 
"cheerful," "solace"), and negative thoughts ("fatigue, "misery," "stressed"). 
 
The researchers utilized information from 33 members to prepare a machine-learning framework to spot contrasts in 
systems of mind action. They at that point tried it on cerebrum pictures from 34 members. The framework accurately 
recognized 15 of 17 self-destructive individuals and 16 of 17 controls—a precision of 91%. The most grounded 
contrasts between the gatherings, all together, were for the words "passing", "joyful," "great," "cold-bloodedness," 
"acclaim," and "inconvenience." Within the gathering of 17 individuals with self-destructive considerations, the 
framework was likewise ready to recognize the 9 who had already influenced a suicide to endeavor from the 8 who 
hadn't with an exactness of 94% (16 out of 17). Segregating locales were spread over a few territories of the cerebrum. 
 

III. PROPOSED APPROACH 

In this proposed approach we need to consider the different architectures of the EHR applications and design the neural 
networks graph based on the variables we are considering. Here we are considering hybrid architecture of the EHR 
which will combine two models of electronic health records. 
 
a. EHR with doctors 
 
Using this EHR application the following table can be formed and used as the sample data collection and based the data 
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collected we need to combine the second model of health records. 
 
In this EHR data we cans see the symptoms, previous health data, personal information of the patient, job related 
information etc. using this kind of information we can form the modal based on which we can plot the graph 1 for the 
patients health condition based on symptoms and their ratio of effect. Figure 6 explains the sample data set we can 
consider 

 
Figure 6: Sample Dataset considered based on the EHR model 

 
a. Dataset collection for Mental Disability. 
We need to collect the dataset for the description of the mental disorders. The reason for considering this dataset is to 
identify the reason for the behavior of the patient. To identify for which symptoms what is chance of mental behavior 
of the patient. The dataset consists of the symptoms and for the specific group of symptoms what will be the behavior 
of the person in future and present too. 
 
This is a typical task for combining the models together to form a new model. 
 

IV. PROPOSED ARCHITECTURE AND RESULTS 
 

In this section we will discuss about the prescribed architecture of the system we are prescribing. Figure 7 indicates the 
architecture of normal EHR applications and will know how we can get the data from the repository and how  we can 
deal with the processing of the data. 
 

 
Figure 7: Collaborating with the physicians and collect the data. 
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In this architecture we will collaborate with the doctors who will use this application and based on their treatment data 
and the considerations we will get the dataset domain specifically. 
 
In figure 8 we will collect the mental disorder patients dataset. 
 

 
 

Figure 8: Mentally disorders patient dataset sample 
 
Based on the available datasets we need to apply the neural networks individually and combine the both models and 
apply again the same model. 
 

V. CONCLUSION 
 
The future work depends on the available datasets in the respective domain and the operations we can perform on those 
domains. In this research work we are focusing on identification of the nature of the person based on his current health 
condition which will help to predict the nature of the patient in the future and help him to rectify him with  his health 
conditions based on the Electronic Health Records data. We need to apply machine learning algorithms like neural 
networks, Decision trees, Random Forest, SVM, CNB Classifier etc for better implementation. 
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