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ABSTRACT: This system consists of pollution sensors array, world Positioning system of mobile phone, single chip 
microcontroller, Bluetooth electronic equipment. Sensors are hardware devices that manufacture measurable response 
to a modification in a very healthiness of air pollution. The analog signal send by the sensors is digitized by an analog 
to digital converter and send to controller for additional process. CO, N, smoke and worker sensor senses the gas and 
communicate the info with microcontroller. Bluetooth modem is employed for transmission the info to mobile. the 
most objective of this method is to incessantly monitor the pollution level provided by the various detector via 
Bluetooth electronic equipment at the management section. hence explicit set up of action ought to be taken to manage 
the pollution 
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I. INTRODUCTION 
 
Indeed, with the increasing variety of vehicles on our roads and fast urbanization pollution has significantly increased  
within the last decades. For the past thirty years the economic development it has  been based on industrial activities 
and therefore the business enterprise trade. Hence, there has been the growth of industries and infrastructure works over 
the island. Industrial combustion processes and stone crushing plants had contributed to the deterioration of the 
standard of the air. Further, the economic success it has diode to a serious increase within the variety of vehicles on the 
roads, making additional pollution downside with smoke emission and alternative pollutants. Air pollution watching is 
taken into account as a advanced task however nonetheless it is very necessary. historically knowledge loggers were 
wont to collect knowledge periodically and this was terribly time overwhelming and quite big-ticket. The use of WSN 
will create pollution watching less advanced and a lot of fast readings are often obtained . 
 

II. EXISTING SYSTEM 
 
A   wireless device   network   (WSN is an   infrastructure comprised of   sensing,   computing   and   communication 
elements  that permits  the  administrator to  monitor  Pollution  management of   the specified    parameters   in the   
network.   Typical application of  WSN  includes knowledge assortment,  monitoring,  surveillance  and Pollution   . 
All  Sensor are deployed over the specified area and the pollution related information is captured from all available  
sensor. 

 
III. PROPOSED SYSTEM 

  
All sensor are deployed over an specified path  after that we collect all information related to pollution and we try to 
find out the trust information of particular sensor .All  the sensor that are deployed over the network  we try  get all 
pollution related information from the available sensor  this pollution related information is major and it transferred to 
appropriate smartphone that are connect in sensor network .It will display all air pollution related information  of 
specific  area  that will display area wise information of air pollution in particular city . 
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Fig.1.Proposed System. 

 
IV. CONCLUSION 

 
The system utilizes detector to gather waste gases like CO, N, smoke and temperature. the information shows the waste 
levels and their to native air quality standards. Here with success application that shows the important time air pollution 
knowledge /air pollutants are often accessible from anyplace here have designed circuit which takes corrective action 
on the rise of pollution on the actual threshold value. 
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